

**The University of Texas at Austin - Project Management & Construction  
RFP/Best Value Summary Evaluation Scoring**

CP

CP577221

Contract

21JOC0200

**Project Description**

JOC for IDIQ Wayfinding and Interior Signage Services

**Points for Cost:**

**Proposers**

Items	Triturn Enterprises dba Austin Arch Graphics	Sign Crafters, Inc.	Campbell's Signs of Texas
<b>Year 1</b>			
<b>7.1.1 ST1 - Trailblazer</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
			<b>HSP REJECTED</b>
7.1.1.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$3,103.03	\$3,806.85	\$4,285.00
7.1.1.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$3,244.65	\$4,361.85	\$5,285.00
7.1.1.3 - Discount for Volume Purchase - Min Qty	5	5	10
Percentage Discount	5.00%	20.00%	10.00%
<b>7.1.2 ST2 - Small Vehicular Directional</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.2.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$4,433.87	\$4,485.55	\$5,340.00
7.1.2.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$4,711.29	\$4,361.85	\$6,340.00
7.1.2.3 - Discount for Volume Purchase - Min Qty	5	5	10
Percentage Discount	5.00%	19.00%	10.00%
<b>7.1.3 ST3 - Medium Vehicular Directional</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.3.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$5,217.63	\$5,162.05	\$6,150.00
7.1.3.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$5,425.21	\$5,809.55	\$7,150.00
7.1.3.3 - Discount for Volume Purchase - Min Qty	5	5	10
Percentage Discount	5.00%	18.00%	10.00%
<b>7.1.4 ST4 Large Vehicular Directional</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.4.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$5,351.49	\$5,283.11	\$6,950.00
7.1.4.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$5,558.10	\$5,930.61	\$7,950.00
7.1.4.3 - Discount for Volume Purchase - Min Qty	5	5	10
Percentage Discount	5.00%	17.00%	10.00%
<b>7.1.5 Oversize Vehicular Directional</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.5.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$7,570.85	\$6,123.07	\$8,200.00
7.1.5.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$7,848.27	\$6,816.82	\$9,200.00
7.1.5.3 - Discount for Volume Purchase - Min Qty	5	5	10
Percentage Discount	5.00%	16.00%	10.00%
<b>7.1.6 ST10 Parking garage ID</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.6.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$7,897.74	\$12,819.90	\$14,650.00
7.1.6.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$8,106.29	\$13,539.90	\$18,500.00
<b>7.1.7 ST11 Parking Lot Information Sign</b>	<b>Ea</b>		

7.1.7.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$4,607.50	\$5,874.61	\$17,250.00
7.1.7.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$4,743.30	\$6,699.61	\$20,000.00
<b>7.1.8 ST12 Parking Garage Information Sign with LED</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.8.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$28,875.93	\$44,794.34	\$41,000.00
7.1.8.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$29,428.83	\$46,299.34	N/A
<b>7.1.9ST12 Guard Kiosk Front Panel</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.9.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$3,034.16	\$3,741.17	\$7,800.00
7.1.9.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$3,103.03	\$4,216.17	\$8,800.00
<b>7.1.10 ST15 Guard Kiosk Front Panel</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.10.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$912.77	\$1,191.43	\$1,100.00
7.1.10.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$971.94	\$1,343.93	\$1,800.00
<b>7.1.11 ST16 Speed Limit Sign</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.11.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$227.95	\$326.10	\$110.00
7.1.11.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$295.85	\$418.60	\$150.00
7.1.11.3 - Discount for Volume Purchase - Min Qty	5	10	10
Percentage Discount	5.00%	23.00%	10.00%
<b>7.1.12 ST17 Parking Regulatory</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.12.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$471.42	\$685.00	\$435.00
7.1.12.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$539.32	\$829.52	\$600.00
7.1.12.3 - Discount for Volume Purchase - Min Qty	5	10	10
Percentage Discount	5.00%	23.00%	10.00%
<b>7.1.13 ST20 Garage Orientation - Freestanding</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.13.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$6,306.94	\$8,987.01	\$7,800.00
7.1.13.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$6,444.68	\$9,634.51	\$8,400.00
<b>7.1.14 ST21 Garage Orientation - Wall Mounted</b>	<b>\$5.</b>		
7.1.14.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$5,227.33	\$5,487.12	\$6,300.00
7.1.14.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$5,365.07	\$5,847.12	\$7,000.00
<b>7.1.15 ST22 Map Stanchion</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.15.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$5,974.23	\$4,619.41	\$6,285.00
7.1.15.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$6,043.10	\$5,266.91	\$7,320.00
<b>7.1.16 ST23 Pedestrian Directional</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.16.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$4,453.27	\$4,812.33	\$4,200.00
7.1.16.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$4,523.11	\$5,459.83	\$5,200.00
<b>7.1.17 ST24 &amp; 25 Handicap Blaze</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.17.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$728.00	\$473.98	\$2,250.00
7.1.17.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$871.00	\$566.48	\$2,850.00
7.1.17.3 - Discount for Volume Purchase - Min Qty	5	10	10
Percentage Discount	5.00%	22.00%	10.00%
<b>7.1.18 ST30 Single-leg, Small Building Identification</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.18.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$2,890.60	\$3,663.49	\$3,600.00
7.1.18.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$2,959.47	\$4,023.49	\$4,200.00
<b>7.1.19 ST31 Single-leg, Large Building Identification</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.19.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$3,772.33	\$5,057.17	\$4,200.00
7.1.19.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$3,841.20	\$5,267.17	\$4,800.00

<b>7.1.20 ST32 Wall-mounted, Small Building Identification Plaque</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.20.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$615.00	\$1,008.89	\$485.00
7.1.20.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$687.00	\$1,211.39	\$585.00
<b>7.1.21 ST33 Wall-mounted, Small Building Identification Plaque</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.21.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$645.00	\$1,043.70	\$535.00
7.1.21.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$717.00	\$1,246.20	\$635.00
<b>7.1.22 ST34 Two-leg, Small Building Identification Plaque</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.22.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$3,610.34	\$6,722.09	\$4,800.00
7.1.22.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$3,748.08	\$7,442.09	\$5,600.00
<b>7.1.23 ST35 Mounument Vertical/Small Internally Illuminated Building Identification</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.23.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$3,933.35	\$10,884.60	\$8,800.00
7.1.23.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$4,071.09	\$11,964.60	\$9,800.00
<b>7.1.24 ST36 Two-leg, Large Building Identification Plaque</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.24.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$4,998.41	\$8,452.18	\$5,800.00
7.1.24.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$5,137.12	\$9,172.18	\$6,800.00
<b>7.1.25 ST37 Monument Vertical/Large Internally Illumnited Building Identification</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.25.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$4,512.44	\$12,909.66	\$12,000.00
7.1.25.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$4,650.18	\$13,989.66	\$13,500.00
<b>7.1.26 ST41 Interpretive Stanchion</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.26.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$5,289.41	\$2,857.79	\$2,400.00
7.1.26.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$5,359.25	\$3,208.79	\$3,100.00
<b>7.1.27 Sign Type 100 - Base Room ADA Identification</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.27.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$36.00	\$77.72	\$33.25
7.1.27.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$39.60	\$92.72	\$43.00
<b>7.1.28 Sign Type 101 - Miscellaneous Message, Tactile</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.28.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$46.00	\$97.92	\$40.25
7.1.28.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$49.45	\$102.92	\$50.25
<b>7.1.29 Sign Type 102 - Miscellaneous Message, Non-Tactile</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.29.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$42.00	\$77.72	\$56.00
7.1.29.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$45.60	\$92.72	\$66.00
<b>7.1.30 Sign Type 103 - Room Identificaiton with Small Message Panel</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.30.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$88.20	\$118.51	\$80.50
7.1.30.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$91.35	\$133.51	\$90.50
<b>7.1.31 Sign Type 104 - Room Identification with Small Insert</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.31.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$102.90	\$141.14	\$94.50
7.1.31.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$106.05	\$156.17	\$104.50

<b>7.1.32 Sign Type 105 - Room Identification with Large Insert</b>				<b>Ea</b>
7.1.32.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$131.25	\$172.90	\$129.50	
7.1.32.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$135.45	\$187.90	\$139.50	
<b>7.1.33 Sign Type 106 - Meeting Room Identification with Medium Insert</b>				<b>Ea</b>
7.1.33.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$137.55	\$172.90	\$142.00	
7.1.33.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$141.75	\$187.90	\$152.00	
<b>7.1.34 Sign Type 107 - Room Identification with Symbol</b>				<b>Ea</b>
7.1.34.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$160.65	\$150.24	\$124.50	
7.1.34.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$163.80	\$165.24	\$134.50	
<b>7.1.34 Sign Type 107.1 - Room Identification with Symbol</b>				<b>Ea</b>
7.1.35.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$168.00	\$161.57	\$124.50	
7.1.35.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$174.30	\$176.57	\$134.50	
<b>7.1.36 Sign Type 108 - Room Identification with Symbol and Two Lines of Text</b>				<b>Ea</b>
7.1.36.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$173.25	\$161.57	\$127.75	
7.1.36.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$175.35	\$176.57	\$137.75	
<b>7.1.37 Sign Type 109 - Regulatory Information Plaque</b>				<b>Ea</b>
7.1.37.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$182.70	\$218.22	\$150.50	
7.1.37.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$185.85	\$238.22	\$160.50	
<b>7.1.38 Sign Type 110 - Large Room Identification Plaque, Non-Tactile</b>				<b>Ea</b>
7.1.38.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$191.00	\$218.22	\$136.50	
7.1.38.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$195.00	\$238.22	\$146.50	
<b>7.1.39 Sign Type 110.1 - Large Room Identification Plaque, Tactile</b>				<b>Ea</b>
7.1.39.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$305.91	\$229.55	\$240.00	
7.1.39.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$309.00	\$244.55	\$250.00	
<b>7.1.40 Sign Type 111 - Stairwell Code Plaque, Tactile</b>				<b>Ea</b>
7.1.40.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$360.50	\$450.37	\$252.00	
7.1.40.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$366.68	\$496.62	\$262.00	
<b>7.1.41 Sign Type 112 - Multipurpose Plaque with 8.5 x 11 Insert, Non-Tactile</b>				<b>Ea</b>
7.1.41.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$350.20	\$280.42	\$136.50	
7.1.41.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$356.38	\$326.67	\$146.50	
<b>7.1.42 Sign Type 113 - Safety Hub Plaque, Non-Tactile</b>				<b>Ea</b>
7.1.42.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$37.08	\$62.15	\$68.00	
7.1.42.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$40.17	\$77.15	\$78.00	
<b>7.1.43 Sign Type 115 - Building Directory</b>				<b>Ea</b>
7.1.43.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$1,781.00	\$2,795.95	\$2,890.00	
7.1.43.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$1,800.00	\$3,120.95	\$3,200.00	
<b>7.1.44 Sign Type 116 - Directional, Small</b>				<b>Ea</b>
7.1.44.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$345.05	\$894.80	\$1,450.00	
7.1.44.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$351.23	\$941.05	\$1,550.00	

<b>7.1.45 Sign Type 117 - Directional, Large</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.45.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$615.00	\$1,222.19	\$1,750.00
7.1.45.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$620.00	\$1,314.69	\$1,850.00
<b>7.1.46 Sign Type 120 - Directional, Ceiling-Mounted</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.46.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$1,369.00	\$1,901.49	\$998.00
7.1.46.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$1,451.00	\$2,178.99	\$1,200.00
<b>7.1.47 Sign Type 121 - Department Identification, Ceiling-Mounted</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.47.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$552.00	\$1,210.77	\$900.00
7.1.47.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$587.00	\$1,435.77	\$1,100.00
<b>7.1.48 Sign Type 121.1 - Department Identification, Flag-Mounted</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.48.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$702.46	\$1,573.33	\$1,285.00
7.1.48.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$738.51	\$1,798.33	\$1,450.00
<b>7.1.49 Sign Type 122 - Blade with Symbol</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.49.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$466.59	\$453.31	\$236.00
7.1.49.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$491.31	\$499.56	\$336.00
<b>7.1.50 Sign Type 123 - Cubicle Partition Hanger</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.50.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$31.00	\$68.66	\$34.00
7.1.50.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$33.00	\$77.66	\$44.00
<b>7.1.51 Sign Type 124 - Desktop Workstation Identification</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.51.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$55.00	\$184.23	NO BID
7.1.51.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$58.00	\$199.23	NO BID
<b>7.1.52 Sign Type 125 - Individual Letterforms</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.52.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$1,050.00	\$2,129.51	\$28.00
7.1.52.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$1,080.00	\$2,592.01	\$40.00
<b>7.1.53 Sign Type 203 - Room Identification with Small Message Panel</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.53.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$94.50	\$118.51	\$90.00
7.1.53.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$97.65	\$133.51	\$100.00
<b>7.1.54 Sign Type 204 - Room Identification with Small Insert</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.54.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$109.20	\$141.17	\$99.75
7.1.54.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$113.40	\$156.17	\$109.75
<b>7.1.55 Sign Type 205 - Room Identification with Large Insert</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.55.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$137.55	\$172.90	\$134.50
7.1.55.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$140.70	\$187.90	\$148.50
<b>7.1.56 Sign Type 206 -Meeting Room Identification with Medium Insert</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.56.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$143.85	\$172.90	\$147.00
7.1.56.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$148.05	\$187.90	\$157.00
<b>7.1.57 Sign Type 207 - Room Identification with Symbol</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.57.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$136.50	\$150.24	\$132.00

7.1.57.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$141.75	\$165.24	\$142.00
<b>7.1.58 Sign Type 207.1 - Room Identification with Symbol</b>			<b>Ea</b>
7.1.58.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$147.00	\$161.57	\$132.00
7.1.58.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$152.25	\$176.57	\$142.00
<b>7.1.59 Sign Type 208 - Room Identification with Symbol and Two Lines of Text</b>			<b>Ea</b>
7.1.59.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$180.60	\$161.57	\$135.00
7.1.59.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$183.75	\$176.57	\$145.00
<b>7.1.60 Sign Type 209 - Regulatory Information Plaque</b>			<b>Ea</b>
7.1.60.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$193.20	\$218.22	\$156.00
7.1.60.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$196.35	\$238.22	\$166.00
<b>7.1.61 Sign Type 210 - Large Room Identification, Non-Tactile</b>			<b>Ea</b>
7.1.61.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$195.30	\$218.22	\$144.00
7.1.61.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$198.45	\$238.22	\$154.00
<b>7.1.62 Sign Type 210.1 - Large Room Identification, Tactile</b>			<b>Ea</b>
7.1.62.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$326.51	\$229.50	\$285.00
7.1.62.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$329.60	\$244.55	\$295.00
<b>7.1.63 Sign Type 211 - Stairwell Code Plaque, Tactile</b>			<b>Ea</b>
7.1.63.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$378.00	\$450.37	\$285.00
7.1.63.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$384.30	\$496.62	\$295.00
<b>7.1.64 Sign Type 212 - Multipurpose Plaque with 8.5 x 11 Insert, Non-Tactile</b>			<b>Ea</b>
7.1.64.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$367.50	\$280.42	\$210.00
7.1.64.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$373.80	\$326.67	\$220.00
<b>7.1.65 Sign Type 215 - Building Directory</b>			<b>Ea</b>
7.1.65.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$2,007.60	\$3,022.55	\$3,200.00
7.1.65.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$2,027.55	\$3,347.55	\$3,500.00
<b>7.1.66 Sign Type 216 - Directional, Small</b>			<b>Ea</b>
7.1.66.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$363.30	\$894.80	\$1,485.00
7.1.66.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$369.60	\$941.05	\$1,600.00
<b>7.1.67 Sign Type 217 - Directional, Large</b>			<b>Ea</b>
7.1.67.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$674.10	\$1,222.19	\$1,900.00
7.1.67.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$680.40	\$1,314.69	\$2,100.00
<b>7.1.68 Sign Type 220 - Directional, Ceiling-Mounted</b>			<b>Ea</b>
7.1.68.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$1,587.60	\$2,128.09	\$1,100.00
7.1.68.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$1,673.70	\$2,405.59	\$1,300.00
<b>7.1.69 Sign Type 221 - Department Identification, Ceiling-Mounted</b>			<b>Ea</b>
7.1.69.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$646.80	\$1,210.77	\$1,900.00
7.1.69.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$683.55	\$1,435.77	\$2,100.00
<b>7.1.70 Sign Type 221.1 - Department Identification, Flag-Mounted</b>			<b>Ea</b>
7.1.70.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$782.25	\$1,573.33	\$585.00

7.1.70.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$820.05	\$1,798.33	\$785.00
<b>7.1.71 Sign Type 222 - Blade with Symbol</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.71.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$508.20	\$453.31	\$250.00
7.1.71.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$533.40	\$499.56	\$450.00
<b>7.1.72 Sign Type 223 - Cubicle Partition Hanger</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.72.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$31.50	\$65.26	\$34.00
7.1.72.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$34.65	\$72.76	\$44.00
<b>7.1.73 Sign Type 224 - Desktop Workstation Identification</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.73.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$57.75	\$184.23	NO BID
7.1.73.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$60.90	\$199.23	NO BID
<b>7.1.74 Sign Type 225 - Individual Letterforms</b>	<b>Ea</b>		
7.1.74.1 - Normal Working Hours	\$1,102.50	\$2,129.51	\$28.00
7.1.74.2 - Other Than Normal Working Hours	\$1,134.00	\$2,592.01	\$40.00

Totals: \$292,974.70 \$421,372.33 \$399,088.75

**ion Services**

<b>50</b>

<b>CAS</b>	<b>Poblocki Sign Company</b>	<b>Baker's Signs</b>
------------	----------------------------------	----------------------

**ch**

INCOMPLETE	INCOMPLETE	INCOMPLETE
PROPOSAL	PROPOSAL	PROPOSAL
DOCUMENTS	DOCUMENTS	DOCUMENTS

**ch**


**ch**


**ch**


**ch**


**ch**


**ch**




ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


.00


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ich


ch


ich


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch


ch		

ch		

ch		

ch		

ch		

ch		

ch		

ch		

ch		

ch		

ch		

ch		

ch		



ch		
ch		
ch		
ch		

#VALUE!